Pacific Corrugated Contech Engineered Solutions
| Vendor 1 Combined Pickup and Vendor 2 Combined Pickup
Schedule Item # | Est.Qty - Feet Size Per Foot Delivery Price Extended Delivery Price | Per Foot Pickup Price | Extended Pickup Price Delivery Price Per Price Extended Delivery Price Per Foot Pickup Price | Extended Pickup Price |and Delivery Price
Schedule 1 12" X16 X0.0508 B 1680 $ 1,008.00 1430 5800 S 186600 | 5 200 § 132000 $ 711§ s 234660
Schedule 1 2 60 12" X 14 X0.079 S 2054 S 123240 $ 1448 $ 868.80 S 2,101.20 | $ 2400 $ 1,44000 S 1867 S 1,12020 $ 2,560.20
Schedule 1 3 40 15"X14X0079 $ 2613 § 104520 § 224 $ 88960 S 1934380 [ § 2738 $ 100520 $ 2738 § 109520 § 2,190.40
Schedule 1 a4 40 18" X 16 X 0.0508 $ 2427 S 97080 $ 2066 S 82640 S 1,797.20 | § 2738 $ 109520 $ 2433 $ 97320 $ 2,068.40
Schedule 1 5 40 18'X14X0079 $ 2087 § 119480 $ 542§ 101680 $ 221160 | $ 2 $ 129280 $ 3150 $ 126000 $ 2,552.80
Schedule 1 6 40 21"X14X0.079 $ 3547 S 141880 $ 3018 $ 120720 $ 2,626.00 | $ 3931 $ 157240 $ 3931 $ 157240 $ 3,144.80
Schedule 1 7 40 24"X16X00508 $ 3173 $ 126920 § 701§ 108040 $ 234960 | $ 3849 $ 153960 $ 3336 $ 133440 $ 2,874.00
Schedule 1 8 40 24"X14X0.079 S 3921 $ 1,568.40 $ 3337 § 133480 $ 2,903.20 | $ 4308 S 172320 $ 4308 S 172320 $ 3,446.40
Schedule 1 9 40 30"X14X0079 $ 5040 $ 201600 § 4290 $ 171600 $ 373200 [ § 5462 $ 218480 $ 5462 § 218080 $ 4,369.60
Schedule 1 10 40 36" X 14 X0.079 S 5974 S 238960 $ 5084 S 203360 $ 442320 | $ 6279 $ 251160 S 6279 S 251160 $ 5,023.20
Schedule 1 1 40 42'X18X0079 $ 6907 § 276280 § 5878 $ 235120 § 511400 | $ 829 $ 331680 $ 8292 § 331680 § 6,633.60
Schedule 1 12 40 48" X 14 X 0.079 S 7841 S 313640 $ 6673 S 2669.20 S 5.805.60 | $ 8229 $ 329160 S 8229 S 329160 $ 6,583.20
Schedule 1 13 40 54"X18X0079 $ 8961 § 358440 § 7626 $ 305040 $ 663480 | $ 10000 $ 400000 $ 10000 $ 400000 $ 8,000.00
Schedule 1 14 40 60" X 12X0.109 $ 13628 S 545120 S 11698 $ 467920 S 10,130.40 | $ 14874 S 5.949.60 S 14874 S 594960 $ 11,899.20
Schedule 1 15 40 66"X12X0.109 $ 14935 $ 597400 § 12700 $ 508400 $ 11,058.00 | § 15756 $ 630240 $ 15756 $ 630240 $ 12,604.80
Schedule 1 16 40 72"X10X0.138 $ 209.08 S 836320 $ 17794 $ 711760 S 15,480.80 | $ 19387 $ 775480 S 19387 $ 7.754.80 $ 15,509.60
$ 43,385.20 36,783.20 $ 46,390.00 $ 45,416.80 S 91,806.80
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 1 80,1¢ TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 1 $ 183,613.60
Schedule 2 1 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 10167 S 4,066.80 S 10167 $ 4,066.80 S 8,133.60
Schedule 2 2 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 14977 $ 5990.80 $ 14977 $ 599080 $ 11,981.60
Schedule 2 3 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16110 $ 644400 S 16110 $ 6,444.00 S 12,888.00
Schedule 2 4 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18857 $ 7,542.80 $ 18857 S 7,54280 $ 15,085.60
Schedule 2 5 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23040 $ 921600 $ 23040 S 9.216.00 $ 18,432.00
Schedule 2 6 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 24660 S 9,86400 $ 24660 S 9,864.00 $ 19,728.00
Schedule 2 7 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 26093 $ 1043720 S 26093 S 10437.20 $ 20,874.40
Schedule 2 8 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 27428 $ 1097120 $ 27428 S 1097120 $ 21,942.40
Schedule 2 9 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29041 $ 11,616.40 S 29041 S 11,616.40 S 23,232.80
Schedule 2 10 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31744 $ 12,697.60 S 31744 $ 1269760 $ 25,395.20
Schedule 2 11 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34125 $ 13,65000 S 34125 S 1365000 $ 27,300.00
Schedule 2 12 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 36771 $ 14,708.40 S 36771 S 14,70840 $ 29,416.80
Schedule 2 13 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37655 $ 15,062.00 S 37655 S 15,062.00 $ 30,124.00
Schedule 2 14 40 3"x 1" (54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 38402 $ 15,360.80 S 38402 S 1536080 $ 30,721.60
Schedule 2 15 40 3"x1"(54") X 14 X 0.079 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 53922 $ 2156880 S 53922 S 21,56880 S 43,137.60
$ 169,196.80 $ 169,196.80
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 2 No Bid TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 2 338,393.60
Schedule 3 1 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 9521 $ 380840 $ 8103 $ 324120 $ 7.049.60 | $ 99.68 $ 3.987.20 $ 9968 S 398720 $ 7.974.40
Schedule 3 2 40 5'x1'(54")X14X0079 [ 14748 $ 589920 $ 12551 § 502040 $ 1091960 | § 14874 $ 594960 $ 14874 S 594960 $ 11,899.20
Schedule 3 3 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 16055 S 642200 $ 13664 S 5.465.60 S 11,887.60 | $ 15756 S 630240 S 157.56 S 630240 $ 12,604.80
Schedule 3 4 40 5'x1'(54")X14X0079 [ 17548 $ 701920 $ 14938 $ 597360 $ 12,99280 | § 18260 $ 730400 $ 18260 $ 730000 $ 14,608.00
Schedule 3 5 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 20348 S 813920 $ 17318 $ 6.927.20 S 15,066.40 | $ 22528 $ 9.011.20 $ 22528 S 9,011.20 $ 18,022.40
Schedule 3 6 40 5'x1'(54")X14X0079 [ 21842 $ 873680 $ 18589 $ 743560 $ 1617240 | § 24715 $ 9,88600 $ 20715 $ 988600 $ 19,772.00
Schedule 3 7 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 23336 S 933440 $ 19860 S 794400 S 17,278.40 | $ 26519 $ 10,607.60 S 26519 S 10,607.60 S 21,215.20
Schedule 3 8 40 5'x1(54")X14X0079 [ 20642 $ 985680 $ 20072 $ 838880 $ 18,245.60 | § 27145 $ 1085800 27145 $ 1085800 § 21,716.00
Schedule 3 9 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 26136 S 10,454.40 S 22243 $ 8,897.20 $ 19,351.60 | $ 28314 $ 11,32560 S 28314 S 1132560 22,651.20
Schedule 3 10 40 5'x1(54")X14X0079 [ 27629 $ 1105160 $ 23514 § 940560 $ 20457.20 | § 30985 $ 1239400 § 30985 $ 1239400 § 24,788.00
Schedule 3 11 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 29123 $ 1164920 $ 247.86 S 9.914.40 S 21,563.60 | $ 32616 $ 13,046.40 S 32616 S 13,046.40 S 26,092.80
Schedule 3 2 40 5'x1'(54")X14X0079 [ 30430 $ 1217200 $ 25898 $ 1035920 2253120 [ § 38606 $ 1384240 31606 S 1384240 § 27,684.80
Schedule 3 13 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 31923 $ 12,769.20 S 27169 $ 10,867.60 S 2363680 | S 36242 S 14,496.80 S 36242 S 14,496.80 S 28,993.60
Schedule 3 1 40 5'x1'(54")X14X0079 [ 33416 $ 1336640 $ 38439 $ 1537560 2874200 | § 37879 $ 1515160 37879 $ 1515160 § 30,303.20
Schedule 3 15 40 5"x1"(54")X 14 X0.079 | S 44431 S 1777240  $ 37814 $ 1512560 S 32,898.00 | $ 53354 $ 2134160 S 53354 S 2134160 S 42,683.20
$ 148,451.20 $ 130,341.60 $ 165,504.40 $ 165,504.40
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 3 278,792.80 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 3 331,008.80
Schedule 4 1 2 42" Type D, S 17478 34956 $ 14875 S 29750 S 647.06 | $ 9219 §$ 18438 S 9219 $ 18438 $ 368.76
Schedule 4 2 2 42 Type D, F, KX X $ 20338 $ 40676 $ 17309 $ 3618 $ 7529 [ $ 9856 $ 19712 % 9856 S 19712 % 39424
Schedule 4 3 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 22313 $ 44626 S 18991 §$ 37982 $ 826.08 | $ 11015 $ 22030 $ 11015 $ 22030 $ 440.60
Schedule 4 4 2 42 Type D, F, KX X $ 25157 $ 50314 § 21410 $ 42820 $ 93134 [ $ 11256 $ 2512 $ 1256 $ 2512 $ 45024
Schedule 4 5 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 27505 S 550.10 $ 23409 $ 468.18 S 1,018.28 | $ 17623 $ 35246 S 17623 S 35246 S 704.92
Schedule 4 6 2 42 Type D, F, KX X s 30459 $ 60018 § 25923 § 51846 S 112768 [ $ 19969 $ 39938 $ 19969 $ 39938 § 798.76
Schedule 4 7 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 33178 $ 66356 S 28237 $ 564.74 S 1,22830 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 8 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 35791 $ 71582 $ 30460 $ 609.20 $ 1,325.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 9 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 38524 S 77048 $ 32787 $ 655.74 S 1,426.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 10 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 41185 $ 82370 $ 35050 $ 70100 $ 1,524.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 11 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 45819 S 91638 $ 38995 $ 77990 S 1,696.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 12 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 48500 $ 97000 $ 41277 $ 82554 S 1,795.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 13 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 51055 $ 1,021.10 $ 43451 $ 869.02 S 1,890.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 14 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 56168 S 1,12336 $ 47803 $ 956.06 S 2,079.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 15 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 586.69 S 1,17338 $ 49931 $ 99862 S 2,172.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schedule 4 16 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 73827 S 147654 $ 62846 S 125692 $ 2,733.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 12519.32 $ 10,655.08 $ 1578.76 1578.76
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 4 23,17 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 4 315
Schedule 5 1 2 42" Type D,F, KX X s 36290 $ 72580 § 30885 $ 617.70 $ 134350 | 18549 $ 37098 $ 18549 $ 37098 $ 741.96
Schedule 5 2 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 41940 S 83880 $ 35694 S 71388 S 1,55268 | $ 21770 $ 43540 S 21770 $ 43540 S 870.80
Schedule 5 3 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 46089 $ 92178 $ 39225 $ 78450 $ 170628 | $ 28962 $ 57924 $ 28962 $ 57924 § 1,158.48
Schedule 5 4 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 51418 S 1,02836 $ 43760 S 87520 S 1,90356 | $ 28360 $ 567.20 S 28360 S 56720 $ 1,134.40
Schedule 5 5 2 42 Type D, F, KX X $ 56580 $ 113160 § 48153 $ 96306 $ 2,004.66 | 32000 $ 65800 $ 32900 $ 65800 § 131600
Schedule 5 6 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 623.04 S 1,246.08 $ 53025 $ 1,060.50 S 2306.58 | $ 33049 $ 660.98 S 33049 S 66098 S 1,321.96
Schedule 5 7 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 67292 $ 134588 § 57270 $ 114540 $ 249124 | $ 21906 $ 43812 $ 21906 $ 312§ 87620
Schedule 5 8 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 72622 S 145244 $ 618.06 $ 123612 $ 2,688.56 | $ 36536 S 73072 S 36536 S 73072 $ 1,461.44
Schedule 5 9 2 42 Type D, F, KX X $ 723 % 155446 § 66147 $ 132298 $ 287740 | $ 39873 $ 797.46 S 39873 $ 797.46 $ 1,594.92
Schedule 5 10 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 82579 S 165158 $ 70281 $ 140562 S 3,057.20 | $ 44570 S 89140 S 44570 S 89140 $ 1,782.80
Schedule 5 1 2 42 Type D, F, KX X s 92468 $ 184936 $ 78696 S 157392 $ 342328 | 50764 $ 101528 § 50764 $ 101528 § 2,03056
Schedule 5 12 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 97288 $ 1,94576 $ 82798 $ 165596 S 360172 | $ 56181 $ 112362 $ 56181 S 112362 $ 2,247.24
Schedule 5 13 2 42 Type D, F, KX X $ 10432 $ 200864 $ 87176 $ 174352 $ 379216 | § 56662 S 113324 § 6662 $ 113324 § 2,266.48
Schedule 5 14 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 112727 $ 225454 S 95938 $ 191876 S 417330 | $ 57955 $ 115910 $ 57955 $ 1,159.10 $ 2,318.20
Schedule 5 15 2 42 Type D, F, KX X s 117762 $ 235524 $ 100223 § 200446 $ 435970 | $ 67500 $ 135000 $ 67500 $ 135000 § 2,700.00
Schedule 5 16 2 42" Type D, F, KX X $ 148125 $ 2,962.50 $ 1,26063 $ 252126 S 5483.76 | $ 75000 $ 150000 $ 75000 S 1,50000 $ 3,000.00
$ 25312.78 $ 21,542.80 S A 5.58 $ 13,410.74 $ 13,410.74
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 5 $ 93,711.16 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 5 26,821.48
Schedule 6 Per Linear Foot Etended Price Per Linear Foot + Extended Per Linear Foot Etended Price Per Linear Foot + Extended
Schedule 6 1 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 169 $ 6760 S 67.60 $ 259 $ 10360 S 103.60
Schedule 6 2 40 22/3x12 15X X H 203§ 8120 § 81.20 s 208§ 11920 $ 11920
Schedule 6 3 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 2711 $ 10840 $ 108.40 $ 397 $ 15880 S 158.80
Schedule 6 4 40 22/3x12 15X X H 339§ 13560 $ 135.60 s 503§ 20120 § 20120
Schedule 6 5 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 406 S 16240 S 162.40 S 638 S 25520 $ 255.20
Schedule 6 6 40 22/3x12 15X X H ama s 18960 $ 189.60 s 760 S 30560 $ 305.60
Schedule 6 7 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 545 $ 21800 $ 218.00 $ 817 $ 32680 $ 326.80
Schedule 6 8 40 22/3x12 15X X H 613§ 20520 $ 245.20 s 1500 $ 60000 $ 600.00
Schedule 6 9 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 681 $ 27240 S 272.40 $ 1802 $ 72080 $ 720.80
Schedule 6 10 40 22/3x12 15X X H 750§ 30000 $ 300.00 $ 1816 $ 72640 $ 726.40
Schedule 6 11 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 818 $ 32720 S 327.20 $ 1977 $ 79080 $ 790.80
Schedule 6 2 40 22/3x12 15X X H 863§ 34520 $ 34520 $ 001 No Bid No Bid
Schedule 6 13 40 22/3"x1/2" 15" X X $ 954 $ 38160 S 381.60 $ 0.01 No Bid No Bid
Schedule 6 14 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 990 $ 39600 $ 396.00
Schedule 6 15 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1511 §$ 604.40 S 604.40
Schedule 6 16 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1639 $ 65560 S 655.60
Schedule 6 17 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1899 §$ 75960 $ 759.60
Schedule 6 18 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1955 $ 78200 $ 782.00
Schedule 6 19 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2130 $ 85200 $ 852.00
Schedule 6 20 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2337 $ 93480 $ 934.80
Schedule 6 21 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2507 $ 1,002.80 $ 1,002.80
Schedule 6 22 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2566 S 1,026.40 $ 1,026.40
Schedule 6 23 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2678 S 107120 $ 1,071.20
Schedule 6 24 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3076 $ 1,23040 $ 1,230.40
Schedule 6 25 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3388 S 135520 $ 1,355.20
Schedule 6 26 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3650 $ 1,46000 $ 1,460.00
Schedule 6 27 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid S 3649 S 145960 $ 1,459.60
Schedule 6 28 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3722 § 1,48880 $ 1,488.80
Schedule 6 29 40 3x154"X X No Bid No Bid $ $ 1,604.40 S 1,604.40
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 6 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SCHEDULE 6 s 16,683.20
The County intends to award to MULTIPLE bidders: Total Vendor 1 Total Vendor 2
Contech Engineered Solutions and Pacific Corrugated Pipe TOTAL PRICE ALL SCHEDULES 478,532.36 TOTAL PRICE ALL SCHEDULES 899,678.20
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