Snohomish County

Bid: ITB-25-0532LY Fencing Services

Opening Date: 10/28/2025 Department: County-wide
FRN Corp AU City Fence
Item No Qty Description Unit Price Ext. Cost Unit Price Ext. Cost
SCHEDULE 1. NEW FENCING INCLUDING INSTALLATION
1 600 7 ft. Coated Chain Link Fence with 3 strands of $39.00 $23,400.00 $89.00 $53,400.00
2 100 6 ft. Coated Chain Link Fence with 3 strands of $36.00 $3,600.00 $79.00 $7,900.00
3 100 6 ft. Coated Chain Link Fence without barbed wire, $34.00 $3,400.00 $74.00 $7,400.00
4 200 4 ft. Coated Chain Link Fence, Installed. $30.00 $6,000.00 $62.00 $12,400.00
5 200 6 ft. Chain Link Fence, galvanized non-coated, with 3 $33.00 $6,600.00 $76.00 $15,200.00
6 200 6 ft. Chain Link Fence, galvanized non-coated, $30.00 $6,000.00 $73.00 $14,600.00
7 200 4 t. Chain Link Fence, galvanized non-coated, $27.00 $5,400.00 $58.00 $11,600.00
8 600 Wildlife Deterrent Aprons at the bottom of fence, $11.00 $6,600.00 $45.00 $27,000.00
Schedule 1 Subtotal $61,000.00 $149,500.00
9 Manufacturer Name of Fencing priced above: BFC Fence Security Contractors Service
10 Warranty One yr labor and materials 20 yr on coated; 3 yr on labor
SCHEDULE 2.A. TIME
1 350 Supervisor $75.00 $26,250.00 $90.00 $31,500.00
2 350 Fence Erector $65.00 $22,750.00 $88.00 $30,800.00
3 350 Fence Laborer $56.00 $19,600.00 $88.00 $30,800.00
4 100 Flagger $50.00 $5,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00
SCHEDULE 2.B. AIRPORT EMERGENCY REPAIR PRICING
5 350 Supervisor $75.00 $26,250.00 $195.00 $68,250.00
6 350 Fence Erector $65.00 $22,750.00 $185.00 $64,750.00
7 350 Fence Laborer $56.00 $19,600.00 $185.00 $64,750.00
Schedule 2.A and 2.B Subtotal $142,200.00 $310,850.00
| TOTAL | $203,200.00 | $460,350.00
Addenda Acknowleged? Yes Yes
Signed? Yes Yes
Accept Pcard w/o Fees? Yes with fee Yes
Prompt Pay Discount? 1% - 20 days 1% - 10 days
Conflict of Interest None N/A
Statement of Bidder Qualification Complete Complete
Projects Similar Size Complete Complete
5 or more consecutive years experience Yes Yes
Certification of Compliance with Wage Payt Statutes Yes Yes
Debarment Lists Checked? Yes Yes
SCHEDULE 2.C. OTHER SCHEDULING RATES FOR REPAIRS After hrs & Weekends Holiday Price After hrs & Weekends Holiday Price
8 100 Supervisor $75.00 $90.00 $150.00 $375.00
9 100 Fence Erector $65.00 $80.00 $145.00 $362.50
10 100 Fence Laborer $56.00 $70.00 $145.00 $362.50
11 25 Flagger $50.00 $60.00 $200.00 $500.00
SCHEDULE 2.D. MATERIAL MARKUP FOR REPAIRS
[ 12 ] $50,000.00 [Percentage markup on materials, to be added to 10% [ $55,000.00 15% | $57,500.00
SCHEDULE 3. SUBCONTRACTOR MARKUP FOR REPAIRS and NEW INSTALLATIONS
| 1 | $5,000.00 |Percentage markup on subcontractors, to be added 10% | $5,500.00 15% | $5,750.00
SCHEDULE 4.A. PRIVACY SLATS
1 Cost for Privacy Slats for 7 ft. Chain Link Fence (See $14.00 $30.50
2 Cost for Privacy Slats for 6 ft. Chain Link Fence (See $12.50 $29.90
3 8 ft. Bear and Elk Deterrent Fencing $18.00 $150.00
SCHEDULE 4.B. TEMPORARY RENTAL FENCING
1A Day 8 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $6.00 $225.00
2A Day 6 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $5.00 $220.00
3A Day 7 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $5.00 $224.00
4A Day 4 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $4.00 $180.00
5A Day Barricade (4’x7.5’) Crowd Control w/base $3.00 $225.00
6A Day Sandbags -one per panel $2.00 $35.00
7A Day 8 Ft. Windscreen Fabric Black or Green $3.00 $168.00
1B Week 8 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $24.00 $185.00
2B Week 6 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $22.00 $180.00
3B Week 7 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $23.00 $184.00
4B Week 4 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $18.00 $160.00
5B Week Barricade (4’x7.5’) Crowd Control w/base $14.00 $195.00
6B Week Sandbags -one per panel $6.00 $35.00
7B Week 8 Ft. Windscreen Fabric Black or Green $9.00 $168.00
1C Month 8 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $65.00 $185.00
2C Month 6 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $60.00 $180.00
3C Month 7 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $62.00 $184.00
4C Month 4 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $50.00 $160.00
5C Month Barricade (4’x7.5’) Crowd Control w/base $40.00 $195.00
6C Month  |Sandbags -one per panel $18.00 $35.00
7C Month 8 Ft. Windscreen Fabric Black or Green $28.00 $168.00
1D Year 8 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $720.00 $170.00
2D Year 6 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $680.00 $169.00
3D Year 7 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $700.00 $169.00
4D Year 4 Ft. High X 10 Ft. Panel, Chain Link, Delivered, $550.00 $159.00
5D Year Barricade (4’x7.5’) Crowd Control w/base $420.00 $175.00
6D Year Sandbags -one per panel $190.00 $35.00
7D Year 8 Ft. Windscreen Fabric Black or Green $300.00 $168.00
Descr Unit Price Descr Unit Price
Monthly rate for 90 day rental
5 $65.00 No bid No bid
Monthly rate tor long term w/
9 screen and sandbag $80.00 No bid No bid
SCHEDULE 3.C. GATES Descr Unit Price Descr Unit Price
1 4 ft Walk Gate; coated $480.00 7'x14' Double Gate Coated $2,700.00
2 6ft Walk Gate; coated $520.00 7'x4' Single Gate Coated $950.00
3 10ft Walk Gate; galvanized $1,200.00 6'x14' Double Gate Coated $2,150.00
4 12ft Walk Gate; galvanized $1,400.00 6'x4' Single Gate $750.00
SCHEDULE 3.D. ADDITIONAL ITEMS Descr Unit Price Descr Unit Price
1 Top rail replacement per ft $12.00 End, corner, pull posts, gate postj $295.00
2 Tension wire install per LF $5.00 Bobcat Digger per Day $350.00
3 Terminal Post set in concrete per $150.00 Jack Hammer per day $150.00
4 Barbed wire replace per LF $2.00 Core Drill per hole $135.00

The County intends to award to the lowest responsive bidders: PRIMARY: FRN Corp. & SECONDARY: Koch Holdings Inc dba All City Fence

The cells highlighted in green are the lowest, responsible responses and
are the recommended primary awardees.

Digitally signed by Yara, Lynne
Date: 2025.11.17 14:30:54 -08'00'

Yara, Lynne

I recommend the above award in accordance with current County Guidelines.

Thornton, Bill

Digitally signed by Thornton, Bill
Date: 2025.11.17 14:57:03 -08'00'

RECOMMENDATION CONCURRED BY PURCHASING MANAGER.
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