
BID # 24-031RB Department:
Open Date11/5/2024 Fleet Management

Items Pierre Ford of Seattle Bickford Motors Pierre Ford of Lynnwood Legacy Bothers
Category Schedule A - Ford Special Ordered Vehicles and Options

A
ELECTRIC (EV)/ HYBRID VEHICLES ALL TYPES (Sedan, Vans, SUV, & Trucks) - All 
Types and  Configurations No Bid $203,845.00 $209,112.00 No Bid

B SUV/CROSSOVER, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $269,010.00 $252,771.00 No Bid
C LIGHT TRUCKS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $173,357.00 $190,407.00 No Bid
D MEDIUM & SUPER DUTY TRUCKS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $196,227.00 $186,249.00 No Bid

E
MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY PASSENGER VANS/CARGO VANS, ALL TYPES & 
CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $99,601.00 $299,570.00 No Bid

F CAB AND CHASSIS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $223,554.00 $172,992.00 No Bid

G
POLICE PERSUIT VEHICLES/SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES (PPV/SSV), SEDANS, 
VANS & TRUCKS ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid $149,806.00 $246,751.00 No Bid

SCHEDULE A - CATEGORY A-G Sub Total $0.00 $1,315,400.00 $1,557,852.00 $0.00

Category Schedule B - Ford In-Stock on Lot Vehicles and Options

A
ELECTRIC (EV)/ HYBRID VEHICLES ALL TYPES (Sedan, Vans, SUV, & Trucks) - All 
Types and  Configurations No Bid No Bid $47,571.00 $272,799.00

B SUV/CROSSOVER, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid $153,240.86 $320,763.50
C LIGHT TRUCKS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid $157,211.92 $233,437.30
D MEDIUM & SUPER DUTY TRUCKS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid $53,496.32 $244,753.50

E
MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY PASSENGER VANS/CARGO VANS, ALL TYPES & 
CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid $53,856.50 $405,787.00

F CAB AND CHASSIS, ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid No Bid $472,991.50

G
POLICE PERSUIT VEHICLES/SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLES (PPV/SSV), SEDANS, 
VANS & TRUCKS ALL TYPES & CONFIGURATIONS No Bid No Bid No Bid $241,552.90

SCHEDULE B - CATEGORY A-G Sub Total $0.00 $0.00 $465,376.60 $2,192,084.70

Schedule C – Original Ford Parts and Accessories
Schedule C - Sub-Total $1,445.28 No Bid $1,487.94 No Bid

Total Bid Amount for Ford Fleet, Parts, and Accessories $1,445.28 $1,315,400.00 $2,024,716.54 $2,192,084.70

GREEN CIRCLE for Recommended Awardee:    Pierre Ford Of Lynnwood
RED CIRCLE for Unacceptable Low Bid
The County intends to award to the lowest responsive bidder:  Pierre Ford Of Lynnwood

I certify that bids were opened and recorded in accordance with current County Guidelines.  

RECOMMENDATION CONCURRED BY PURCHASING MANAGER:

Fleet Vehicles, Ford (Various Types)
Product/Service


	Sheet1

		2024-11-05T15:59:26-0800
	Berry, Rutherford


		2024-11-05T16:02:03-0800
	Thornton, Bill




