
BID #: ITB-25-0418RB Bid descripition:

Opening Date: 4/22/2025 Department /Division : Public Works /Roads Maintenance

NAME OF BIDDERS

Item Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
No. Items Quantity Price Price Amount Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Schedule 1 

1 Crushed Surfacing Top Course 12,000 $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $180,000.00 $18.00 $216,000.00 $10.50 $126,000.00 $18.50 $222,000.00 $18.00 $216,000.00 $13.50 $162,000.00 $13.50 $162,000.00 $21.30 $255,600.00 $16.00 $192,000.00 $14.40 $172,800.00

2 Crushed Surfacing Base Course 10,000 $14.00 $140,000.00 $15.00 $150,000.00 $18.00 $180,000.00 $10.50 $105,000.00 $18.50 $185,000.00 $16.80 $168,000.00 $12.00 $120,000.00 $13.50 $135,000.00 $21.30 $213,000.00 $16.00 $160,000.00 $13.80 $138,000.00

3
Crushed Surfacing Top Course 

with Recycled Materials
10,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 2”-4” Quarry Spalls 5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.40 $192,000.00 $10.50 $52,500.00 $15.50 $77,500.00 $33.80 $169,000.00 $15.50 $77,500.00 $16.20 $81,000.00

5 4”-8” Quarry Spalls 5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.40 $192,000.00 $10.50 $52,500.00 $15.50 $77,500.00 $34.60 $173,000.00 $15.50 $77,500.00 $15.60 $78,000.00

6 Light Loose Rip Rap 5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $18.00 $90,000.00 $25.00 $125,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.00 $140,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

7 Heavy Loose Rip Rap 5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $18.00 $90,000.00 $25.00 $125,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34.00 $170,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

8

Type 1 Rock for Rock Wall 

(Armorstone)
5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $175,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 $200,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

9

Type 2 Rock for Rock Wall 

(Armorstone)
5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 $105,000.00 $35.00 $175,000.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $200,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

10

Type 3 Rock for Rock Wall 

(Armorstone)
5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 $105,000.00 $35.00 $175,000.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $200,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

11

Type 4 Rock for Rock Wall 

(Armorstone)
5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 $105,000.00 $35.00 $175,000.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $200,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

12

Type 6 Rock for Rock Wall 

(Armorstone)
5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 $105,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $250,000.00 $36.00 $180,000.00

13 2.5 Inch Minus Chips 2,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $44,000.00 No Bid No Bid $12.00 $24,000.00 $16.50 $33,000.00 $35.70 $71,400.00 $16.25 $32,500.00 $19.20 $38,400.00

14 Gravel Backfill for Drains 1,000 $11.00 $11,000.00 $15.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $22,000.00 $11.70 $11,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.50 $35,500.00 $21.00 $21,000.00 $18.00 $18,000.00

15

Gravel Backfill for Pipe Zone 

Bedding 
1,000 $10.00 $10,000.00 $6.50 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15,000.00 $11.70 $11,700.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $21.30 $21,300.00 $16.00 $16,000.00 $13.20 $13,200.00

16 Gravel Backfill for Walls 1,000 $9.00 $9,000.00 $6.50 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15,000.00 $11.70 $11,700.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $16.00 $16,000.00 No Bid No Bid

17 Gravel Borrow 1,000 $9.00 $9,000.00 $6.50 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $7,500.00 $15.00 $15,000.00 $11.70 $11,700.00 No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12,000.00 $15.50 $15,500.00 No Bid No Bid $13.20 $13,200.00

18 Streambed Cobbles 4” 200 $9.00 $1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.80 $2,160.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $36.60 $7,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Streambed Cobbles 6” 200 $9.00 $1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.80 $2,160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.50 $8,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Streambed Cobbles 8” 200 $15.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.50 $8,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 Streambed Cobbles 10” 200 $15.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.10 $8,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 Streambed Cobbles 12” 200 $26.00 $5,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.10 $8,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Streambed Sediment (Fish Mix) 1,000 $15.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $22,000.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 $36,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.50 $38,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24
Aggregate For Gravel Base (Pit 

Run)
1,000 $10.00 $10,000.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12,000.00 $6.00 $6,000.00 $10.00 $10,000.00 $15.50 $15,500.00 $13.00 $13,000.00 $12.00 $12,000.00

25 Coarse Maintenance Sand 10,000 $13.00 $130,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50 $175,000.00 No Bid No Bid $15.60 $156,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.55 $285,500.00 No Bid No Bid $20.40 $204,000.00

Schedule 2

1

Coarse Maintenance Sand 

Delivered to 19620 67th Ave NE 

Arlington, WA 98223

5,000 No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid $0.00 $0.00 No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid $38.00 $190,000.00 No  Bid No  Bid $0.00 $0.00

2

Coarse Maintenance Sand 

Delivered to 8915 Cathcart Way 

Snohomish, WA 98296

5,000 No Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid $0.00 No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid $0.00 $0.00 No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid No  Bid $44.55 $222,750.00 No  Bid No  Bid $0.00 $0.00

Minimum Order Quantity No No Yes No No Yes No No No No No

Bid Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes No Yes Yes No No Yes Yes No No

No No No N/A No N/A No No N/A No No

I certify that bids were opened and recorded

in accordance with current County Guidelines______________________________Date: ______________

RECOMMENDATION CONCURRED BY PURCHASING MANAGER

Signature: ________________________________________________ Date: _________________________________

Accept Pcard Payment w/out fees

Accept Pcard Payment with fees

The County intends to award to MULTIPLE bidders:   

Unit PriceUnit Price

Pit & Quarry Products: Crushed Stone, Quarry Spalls, and Aggregate Materials

Lenz Industries Stanwood Iron Mountain Quarry Heidelberg Materials

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Menzel Lake Gravel Granite Construction Lakeside Industries Lenz Industries Sand Hill Centennial Rock Products Green Dream International Skaglund Quarry A & E LLC.
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